
TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF ENTRY 

Promotion and Promoter Details 

• The name of the promotion is “Guess the number of 
Easter Egg Competition: Northpoint Easter Promotion” 
(Promotion). The Promotion will consist of three (3) 
events (each a Promotion Event). 

• The promoter of the Promotion is Cromwell Corporation 
Limited ABN 44 001 056 980 of Level 19, 200 Mary 
Street, Brisbane, Queensland 4000 (Promoter). 

Location 

• The promotion will be held at Northpoint, 100 Miller 
Street, North Sydney, New South Wales 2060 (the 
Building) 

Eligibility 

• Entry is open to natural persons aged 18 years and over 
(Eligible Entrants). 

• The following persons are ineligible to enter the 
Promotion: 

o persons under the age of 18;  

o employees, directors and contractors of the 
Promoter or any related entity of the Promoter; and 

o immediate family members of employees, directors 
and contractors of the Promoter or any related entity 
of the Promoter. 

Entry 

• The Promotion Period for each Promotion Event is: 

o The first Promotion Event commences at 10:00AM 
AEST on 16/04/2019 and entries close at 3:00PM 
AEST on 16/04/2019; 

o The second Promotion Event commences at 
10:00AM AEST on 17/04/2019 and entries close at 
3:00PM AEST on 17/04/2019; and 

o The third Promotion Event commences at 10:00AM 
AEST on 18/04/2019 and entries close at 3:00PM 
AEST on 18/04/2019. 

• To enter a Promotion Event, Eligible Entrants must 
complete an entry through the iPad at the Promotion 
Event stand located in the Building foyer during each 
Promotion Period (an entry). On the entry form, 
participants in a Promotion Event must include their full 
name, current email address,  whether they work at 
Northpoint Tower and answer to the Promotion question: 
“Guess the number of Easter Eggs in the jar” 
(Promotion Question).  

• A jar containing the Easter Eggs relevant to each 
Promotion Event will be on display at a stand in the foyer 
of the Building during each Promotion Period. 

• Only one (1) entry per person is permitted in each 
Promotion Event.  

Prizes and winning 

• The judging will be conducted by the Promoter on or 
shortly after 3:00PM AEST after entries close for each 
Promotion Event. 

• The (1) valid entry that responds to the Promotion 
Question with the: 

o (first) correct; or  

o (second) closest guess to the correct; 

number of Easter Eggs, not including the Easter 
Bunnies, in the jar, as finally determined by the judges, 
will be deemed the winner of the Promotion Event and 
will receive one (1) jar of Easter Eggs and Easter 
Bunnies (Prize). 

• If two or more entrants either correctly guess or submit 
the closest guess to the Promotion Question, the first 
entrant will be selected as the winner. 

• Each Prize is valued at A$350.00. 

Promotion and Prize conditions 

• Each Promotion Event is a game of skill; chance plays 
no part in determining the winner. The response to each 
Promotion Question that is closest to the correct answer 
will be judged the winner. 

• The winner of each Promotion Event is determined in 
accordance with these Terms and Conditions of Entry 
and is final and binding on every person who enters. No 
correspondence will be entered by the Promoter. 

• The winner will be notified by email using contact details 
provided on their entry.  

• The winner must physically claim the Prize from a 
representative for the Promoter within (4) Sydney 
business days. A representative for the Promoter is 
usually available at the site office of the Building 
between the hours of 9:00AM and 5:00PM on each 
Sydney business day. 

• The winner must present photo identification at the time 
of collection. 

• If the winner does not present themselves to a 
representative for the Promoter within the stated time, 
the selection may be deemed invalid (Invalid Selection) 
at the discretion of the Promoter.  

• If the Promoter deems that there has been an Invalid 
Selection, a redraw will occur on the next Sydney 
business day at 9:00AM and the above process will be 
followed again until a valid winner claims the Prize. 

• The Prize is not exchangeable or redeemable for cash. 
The Prize must be taken as offered and may not be 
varied. 

Retailer promotion conditions 

• Each entrants is permitted to receive one (1) voucher 
per Promotion Event, entitling the entrant to the lesser 
discount of: 

o 10% of the transaction value; or  

o A$10.00 per transaction, 

at all participating retailers at the Building, valid during 
Sydney business hours on the day of each Promotion 
Event. 

• Participating retailers will be specified on the voucher. 
The discount is limited to one transaction per retailer. 

• The 10% discount is not be used in conjunction with any 
other retailer discount or offer. 

• Retailers will stamp/mark/clip the entrant’s voucher 
when the entrant makes a purchase at the retailer’s 
business. 

• Upon presenting and surrendering a voucher to the 
Promoter’s representative at the Building, the entrant will 
be entitled to receive one (1) chocolate per three 
transactions recorded on the voucher.  

• Chocolates will be limited to 100 per Promotion Event. 

Other conditions 

• These Terms and Conditions of Entry take precedence 
to any words or representations that may be printed or 
expressed on any entry form or materials relating to the 
Promotion. 

• All entries into the Promotion become the sole property 
of the Promoter. 

• The Promoter will not be liable for any Prize being lost, 
stolen or damaged after the Prize has been released to 
the winner. 



• The Promoter accepts no responsibility for any entry 
form in relation to the Promotion not received for any 
reason during the Promotion Period. No responsibility 
will be taken for lost, late or misdirected entry forms. 

• The Promoter is entitled to amend, edit, select, crop, 
retouch, add to or delete from any part of the submitted 
entry. 

• If a winner agrees to participate in any promotion activity 
(such as publicity and photography) relating to the 
winning of the Prize as requested by the Promoter, it is 
done so free of charge. The winner of each Promotion 
Event consents to the Promoter using their name and 
image in any future promotional material. 

• By entering this competition, entrants agree to receive 
relevant communications from Northpoint Tower and 
Cromwell Property Group, including news, publications, 
promotions, events, offers, competitions, product 
information, advertisements and updates. 

• The information entrants provide (Personal Information) 
will be used by the Promoter in line with these Terms 
and Conditions of Entry and the Cromwell Property 
Group Privacy Policy available at 
www.cromwellpropertygroup.com. 

• This Promotion is operated in accordance with the laws 
of the state of New South Wales. 


